REPUBLIC OF NAMIBIA
OSHANA REGIONAL COUNCIL

PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT UNIT
Tel: 065 — 2288260 Private Bag 5543
Fax: 065-221 292 Oshakati, Namibia

E-mail: pmu@oshanare.gov.na
Enquiries: Alma Kamulilo

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY OF BID EVALUATION REPORT

1. Project Title: Construction of ECD playground at Oshitayi and Namangundu ECD centres for Division of Gender
Equality and Child Welfare - LOT 2

Reference number of procurement: W/RFQ/ONARC-DGESW- 96/2025/2026

I. Scope of Contract: Work

2. Procurement method used: Request for Quotation

3. Date of Invitation of Bids: 14/10/2025

4. Closing date for submission of bids: 30/10/2025

5. Date and place of opening of bids: 30/10/2025, Oshana Regional Council, PMU
6. Number of bids received by closing date: 31

7. Responsiveness of bids: 2



NO Bidder’ s Name Submitted Bid Responsive | Reasons why bid is not
Amount (N§) or not responsive
responsive
(Yes/ No)

L. Moshipya Building Construction cc 229 144.40 Yes

2. | GSEG Investment Holding (Pty) LTD cc 242 170.52 Yes

3. Absalom Investment cc 112, 744.28 No Site personnel only having
level 2 instead of 5

4. Utuja One One Zero Six Trading Enterprise cc 14% 021.77 No No GCC page 5 not
completed

5. Batusho Investment cc 228 972.19 No No CV and Qualification of
site personnel

6. David Investment cc 252 105.33 No Bid securing declaration on
page 10 not completed

7. | Afi trading cc 233 119,95 No No site personnel CV and
qualification not attached

8. Artisan Multi Trading cc 240 745,31 No Site personnel qualification
not attached

9. Friday Investment cc 191 074.00 No Bid securing declaration on
page 10 not completed

10. | Busby Trading cc 229 944.20 No Bid securing declaration on
page 10 not completed

11. | Kambulonga Investment cc 196 (:79.89 No Below the budget




12. | A87 world Investment cc 183 385.44 No Bid securing declaration on
page 10 not completed

13. | Om’kuto Contractor and Developer cc 183 882.93 No Below the budget

14. | Atrix Investment ¢¢ 263 284.51 No Bid securing declaration on
page 10 not completed

15. | Hope Stone Welding Work cc 760 133.70 No GCC page 5 not completed

16. | Coskem Investment cc 222 432.00 No No ¢ooperate seal and price
activity schedule page 2
and 3 not completed

17. | Geolleni and Sons Trading cc 229 213.69 No Written undertaking not
completed

18. | Knox and Daughters Investment cc 171 786.20 No Below the budget

19. | Endola Construction and Technologies cc 171 974.25 No Below the budget

20. | Pigeon Industries cc 181 938.75 No GCC on page 6 not
completed

21. | BNG Investment cc 296 694.84 No Site personnel qualification
not attached

22. | Minusens Trading cc 229 144.15 No Site personnel qualification
not attached

23. | M.K liviyongo Investment cc 130 669.65 No Below the budget

24. | Mapheti Trading cc 151 897.46 No Below the budget

25. | Kaluanda Trading cc 175 908.98 No Below the budget

26. | Expand Africa Investment cc 184 951.52 No Bid securing declaration on

page 10 not completed




27. | Kambwa Construction cc 214 047.49 No GCC on page 5and 6
incomplete

28. | Bridgetown Investment cc 164 719.18 No GCC on page 5and 6
incomplete

19. | Kassaduous Trading Enterprises cc 159 774.00 No Mandatory document not
attached

30. | Bit Coin Trading cc 159 774.51 No Site personnel only having
level 2 instead of 5

31. | Ehenge-Lamamanya Investment cc 168 224.53 No No site personnel CV and

qualification not attached

8. Best Evaluated Bid of GSEG Investment Holding (Pty) LTD ce




