REPUBLIC OF NAMIBIA

] OSHANA REGIONAL COUNCIL |

PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT UNIT

Tel: 065 — 2288260

Fax: 065-221292

E-mail: pmuf@oshanare.cov.na
Enquiries: Moses Matatias

Private Bag 5543
Oshakati, Namibia

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY OF BID EVALUATION REPORT

1. PROJECT TITLE: DESIGN AND PRINTING OF REPORTS
REFERENCE NUMBER OF PROCUREMENT: G/ONB/ONARC-07/2024/2025

Scope of Contract:

I~

Procurement method used:
Date of Invitation of Bids:
Closing date for submission of bids:

Date and place of opening of bids:

Noe R W

Responsiveness of bids: 1

Number of bids received by closing date:

GOODS

ONB

12/07/2024

23/08/2024

09/01/2025, Oshana Regional Council, PMU
15



NO Bidder’ s Name Sabmitted Bid | Responsive | Reasons why bid is not responsive
Amount (N3) or not
responsive
(Yes/ No)

1. | TRACE DURBAN INVESTMENT 29 708.00 No Bid submission sheet not stamped,
P.5

2. | LAUDIMA TRADOMG CC 125 671.26 No Bid submission sheet form not
stamped, P. 5
The person who signed the bid is
not the same person who is given
the power of attorney
Signed by unauthorized person

3. | MAD BULL INVESTMENT CC 3433440 No Period offered is 90 days not 180
days as stipulated

4. | JARON TRADING ENTERPRISES CC 81324.75 No Bid submission sheet form not

' stamped, P.5

Written statement by power of
attorney not attached

5. | KAWHKOSHWA TRADING CC 1006 452.17 Yes

6. | MENO INVESTMENTS CC 92 445.00 No Blank, Pages 44 and 43

Written Statement by power of
attorney not attached




Not signed

All pages are blank

KANKU TRADING CC

49 435.62

No

Bid submission sheet form not
stamped, P. 5

Written Statement by power of
attorney not attached

Correction not initialed, pages
50,54,55,63,69,78 and 79

WALTONS NAMIBIA PTY LTD

90 899.57

No

Bid submission sheet form not
stamped, P. 5

P.61 Item 65 not completed

Did not quote all items

PARMENAS INVESTMENT CC

47 218.20

Bid submissicen sheet form not
stamped, P. 5

Written Statement by power of
attorney not attached

10.

WELTON INVESTMETN CC

41933.48

No

Bid submission sheet form not
stamped, P. 5

Written Statement by power of
attorney not attached

11.

STAR COMETS TRADING CC

45 112.90

Yes

(VS




12.0 TMU SUPPLY AND DELIVEY 52 814.59 No Written Statement by power of
attorney not attached

13.] LENI TRADING CC 90 196.03 No Bid submission sheet form not
stamped, P. 5

14.| MEXY TRADING CC 103 898.00 Yes

15.0 AMUTANGA TRADING ENTEPRISES CC 64 826.82 Yes

8. Price comparison for bids that are substantially responsive

NO. Bidder’s Name A. Bid Amount at opening (NS)
I. Star Comets Trading CC 45112.90

2. Amutanga Trading Enterprices CC | 64 826.82

3. Mexy Trading CC 103 898.00

4. Kamwiikosha Trading 106 452.17

9. Best FEvaluated Bid

Star Comets Trading CC




